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Kind regards, 
 
Ola 
 
Aleksandra Szweblik BSc (Hons) 
Project Assistant 
for Jiva Consulting SAGL 
 
Tel: +41 799626517 
 
=================================== 
  
This message and any attachments are confidential and are only intended for the recipient(s) to which they have been addressed. 
If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete the message from your system. The 
contents of this misdirected mail may not be saved, recorded or used for any purpose whatsoever or made available to 
unauthorised persons. This message has been prepared and sent with the greatest possible care, including scanning for viruses. 
In spite of this, we assume no liability whatsoever for the existence of any viruses. 
 
=================================== 
 

From: Сергей Ковалишин <skovalyshyn@mail.ru> 
Reply-To: Сергей Ковалишин <skovalyshyn@mail.ru> 
Date: Friday, 6 February 2015 16:49 
To: Charles Treherne <c.t@jivaconsulting.ch> 
Cc: Aleksandra <a.s@jivaconsulting.ch> 
Subject: Re: Snow 
 
Dear Charles and Ola, 
 
my cuurent working e-mail: skovalyshyn@gmail.com . 

 
that is another technical agreements that were developed six months ago aimed at technical transfer of money 
to different companies. Of course, no one is going to make such technical transfers. But such 
agreements should be signed and you should have them.  
 
In February it is neccessary to pay only the sums that I have indicated in the file. 
 
Best regards, 
 
 
Четверг, 29 января 2015, 11:25 UTC от Charles Treherne <c.t@jivaconsulting.ch>: 

Dear Sergei,  
 
i understand that you are involved in this project, can i ask you to confirm that we can proceed with the below 
mentioned request (loan agreement), as our Principle is not sure, suggested i asked you…. 
 
thank you. 
 
Best Regards 
Charles Treherne 
 
c.t@jivaconsulting.ch 
 
 
 
Begin forwarded message: 
 

From: business blues <wealth.business.blues@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: loan agreements 
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Date: 20 January 2015 16:32:38 CET 

To: Ola <a.s@jivaconsulting.ch>, Charles Treherne <c.t@jivaconsulting.ch> 
 
Dear Charles,  
 
I trust you spent wonderful Holidays. 
 
We need to sign another loan agreement (attached) between Teleferic and BRH, the same as with Borzhava 
Invest and other companies.  
 
Also could you please send me extract from the register regarding Teleferic ownership.  
 
Kind regards, 
Alex 
 
On Thu, May 8, 2014 at 4:41 PM, business blues <wealth.business.blues@gmail.com> wrote: 
 

 
 


